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Abstract 

This article presents a qualitative analysis of healthcare professionals' perceptions of therapeutic patient education 
(TPE) in hematology. TPE is recognized as essential in managing chronic hematological diseases, enabling patients to 
better understand and manage their condition. The study reveals that healthcare professionals view TPE positively, 
emphasizing its crucial role in patient autonomy and therapeutic adherence. However, several barriers to its 
implementation are identified, including lack of time, inadequate educational resources, and insufficient continuous 
training. Professionals suggest improvements such as dedicating more time to TPE and introducing more interactive 
teaching materials. They also underline the importance of continuous training to better integrate TPE into clinical 
practice. The study concludes that TPE not only enhances patients' disease management but also improves the 
caregiver-patient relationship, contributing to better clinical outcomes. 
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1. Introduction

Therapeutic patient education (TPE) plays a significant role in managing chronic diseases. In hematology, the 
complexity of conditions and prolonged treatments require active patient involvement. TPE aims to make patients more 
autonomous by equipping them with the knowledge and skills necessary to understand and manage their disease daily 
(1). However, the implementation of TPE largely depends on the perceptions and practices of healthcare professionals, 
who are the main actors in this educational approach(2). 

In hematology, conditions such as leukemias, lymphomas, and other blood disorders necessitate a tailored educational 
approach due to their often-severe nature and extended treatment durations. Healthcare professionals play a central 
role in supporting patients, not only by providing care but also by educating them about their condition and supporting 
them throughout their therapeutic journey. Their perception of TPE directly impacts the quality and effectiveness of 
established programs, as well as patients' engagement with these initiatives. 

Despite the undisputed importance of TPE, several studies highlight the challenges healthcare professionals face in its 
effective implementation. These challenges include a lack of time, limited resources, and communication difficulties 
with patients. Furthermore, healthcare professionals’ attitudes and beliefs can vary based on their training, experience, 
and specialization, leading to disparities in TPE application. 
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It is thus imperative to analyze healthcare professionals' perceptions of TPE in hematology to better understand the 
factors facilitating or hindering this approach. A deeper understanding of these perceptions could help develop targeted 
strategies to improve TPE integration into clinical practice(3,4). 

This qualitative study aims to explore the perceptions of healthcare professionals in hematology, highlighting both the 
positive aspects of their experience and the challenges they face. The goal is to gather detailed data to formulate practical 
recommendations for optimizing TPE in this specific field. 

This article seeks to enhance understanding of how healthcare professionals perceive and implement TPE in 
hematology, providing perspectives to improve program effectiveness and, consequently, patient outcomes. 

2. Methodology 

2.1. Study Type 

The study is qualitative, examining healthcare professionals' perceptions of TPE in hematology. This approach was 
chosen for its ability to yield rich, detailed data, illuminating participants’ attitudes, beliefs, and experiences—essential 
for understanding TPE dynamics in a specific context. 

2.2. Participants 

The sample comprises 15 healthcare professionals working in hematology (7 physicians and 8 nurses). Participants 
were selected using purposive sampling, which ensures inclusion based on relevant experience and involvement. The 
sample size was determined according to the principle of data saturation, stopping when interviews yielded no new 
information. 

2.3. Data Collection 

Data were collected between January and February 2024 through semi-structured interviews. This method was chosen 
for its ability to guide discussions while allowing participants to express their experiences and perceptions freely. An 
interview guide with open-ended questions was prepared, covering various aspects of TPE, such as understanding its 
objectives, challenges faced, and strategies employed to overcome these difficulties. Interviews were recorded (with 
participant consent) and fully transcribed for analysis. 

2.4. Data Analysis 

Data were analyzed using thematic analysis, identifying, analyzing, and reporting themes within the data. Transcriptions 
were reviewed multiple times for familiarization, followed by initial coding to identify relevant text segments. These 
codes were then grouped into broader themes reflecting healthcare professionals' perceptions. Analysis was conducted 
inductively, allowing themes to emerge directly from the data without a pre-established theoretical framework. 

2.5. Reliability and Validity 

To ensure rigor, several strategies were employed. Data triangulation involved comparing perspectives from different 
professional groups. Member checking was conducted by sharing preliminary findings with participants to verify that 
the interpretations accurately reflected their perceptions. Finally, a reflective journal documented the researcher’s data 
collection and analysis process and personal reflections potentially influencing interpretations. Participant anonymity 
and data confidentiality were maintained throughout. 

2.6. Ethical Considerations 

The study adhered to ethical principles, obtaining informed consent from participants prior to inclusion. Participant 
anonymity was guaranteed, and data were handled confidentially. The research protocol was approved by an ethics 
committee under the reference number 74/2024. 

3. Results 

3.1. General Perceptions of Healthcare Professionals on TPE in Hematology 

The healthcare professionals interviewed expressed an overall positive perception of Therapeutic Patient Education 
(TPE) in hematology, considering it a key element in the management of patients with hematological diseases. The 
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majority of participants emphasized that TPE enables patients to better understand their illness, feel more involved in 
their treatment, and adopt behaviors that are beneficial to their health. One hematologist said: 
“TPE is essential. It allows patients to understand the stakes of their treatment and become active participants in their own  
health. This is especially important in the context of pathologies as complex as those we encounter in hematology.”  
Specialized nurses also highlighted the impact of TPE on treatment adherence, noting that better-informed patients 
were more likely to properly follow their treatments and proactively report side effects. 

3.2. Challenges Encountered During Patient Education 

Despite the recognition of the importance of TPE, several challenges were identified by healthcare professionals. The 
lack of time was mentioned by all participants as the main obstacle to the effective implementation of TPE. One doctor 
explained: 
“Time is a real challenge. We have very busy consultations, and it is difficult to find enough time to conduct therapeutic 
education properly. Sometimes, we must settle for the essentials, which is not always enough for the patients.” 

Additionally, participants noted a lack of specific resources, such as educational materials suited to the various levels of 
patient understanding. Some professionals also mentioned a lack of continuing education in TPE, which limits their 
ability to use innovative teaching approaches and incorporate new knowledge into their practice. 

3.3. Patients’ Perceptions of TPE 

Healthcare professionals reported that patients' perceptions of TPE were generally positive, although some patients 
were initially reluctant. Well-informed patients often expressed a sense of empowerment and better management of 
their condition. One nurse mentioned: 

“Well-informed patients often become more independent and confident. They ask more questions, are more engaged in 
their treatment, and are more proactive in managing their health.” 

However, it was noted that some patients, particularly those dealing with emotional burdens or high levels of stress, 
may struggle to absorb information. Professionals emphasized the importance of creating TPE programs tailored to the 
individual needs of patients to overcome these obstacles. 

3.4. Suggestions for Improving TPE 

Participants made several suggestions to improve TPE in hematology. The first suggestion was to allocate more time 
specifically for TPE in consultation schedules, allowing healthcare providers to give patients the attention they need. 
Another recommendation was to invest in the creation of more diverse educational materials, including digital and 
interactive tools that could make information more accessible. 

Finally, several professionals stressed the need for ongoing training for healthcare teams to keep them up-to-date with 
best practices in TPE and to integrate these practices into their daily interactions with patients. One doctor summarized 
this idea by saying: 

“We need continuous training to adapt to the rapid developments in TPE. This would allow us to provide even better support 
to our patients.” 

3.5. Impact of TPE on the Healthcare Provider-Patient Relationship 

Another key finding of the study was the positive impact of TPE on the relationship between healthcare providers and 
patients. Professionals noted that TPE fosters more open communication and strengthens patient trust in the healthcare 
team. This dynamic was seen as beneficial not only for improving treatment adherence but also for the psychological 
well-being of patients. One nurse described: “TPE really improves our relationship with patients. They feel listened to, 
understood, and this strengthens their trust in us. It’s a virtuous circle that benefits everyone.” 

4. Discussion 

The results of this study highlight contrasting perceptions among healthcare professionals regarding TPE in 
hematology, revealing both the perceived importance of TPE and the barriers hindering its effective implementation. 
This discussion aims to interpret these findings in light of existing literature, identify practical implications for 
hematology care, and propose recommendations for improving current practices. 
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4.1. Recognition of the Importance of TPE in Hematology 

Healthcare professionals unanimously acknowledged the importance of TPE in the management of hematological 
patients. This aligns with the literature, which emphasizes that TPE is particularly crucial in the management of chronic 
diseases, where it contributes to patient empowerment, better understanding of their condition, and increased 
treatment adherence(5–7). In hematology, where diseases are often severe and require complex treatments, TPE plays 
a crucial role in allowing patients to actively participate in their care, reducing the risk of non-adherence, and improving 
clinical outcomes(8). 

However, despite the widespread recognition of TPE’s importance, its implementation remains a challenge, as 
highlighted by several participants. This gap between the recognition of the importance of TPE and its actual 
implementation warrants particular attention and reflects structural issues within healthcare institutions. 

4.2. Time and Resource Challenges 

The lack of time was identified as the main barrier to the implementation of TPE by all healthcare professionals 
interviewed. This challenge is not unique to hematology; it is widely documented in the literature as a common barrier 
to TPE across various medical contexts (9,10). Time constraints limit healthcare providers' ability to engage in in-depth 
discussions with patients and provide education that is tailored to their needs. In a context where consultations are 
often busy, it becomes difficult for healthcare professionals to dedicate sufficient time to TPE, which may compromise 
the quality of information provided and the overall effectiveness of education programs. 

In addition to time, the lack of specific resources, such as tailored educational materials, was also mentioned. This 
resource shortage limits the ability of healthcare professionals to adapt TPE to the varying levels of patient 
understanding(11). Participants expressed a need for more diversified and interactive educational materials, a demand 
echoed in the literature, where the use of visual and digital tools is highlighted as greatly enhancing patient information 
retention. 

4.3. Continuing Education for Healthcare Professionals 

Another major challenge identified was the lack of continuing education in TPE for healthcare professionals. Although 
participants had a general understanding of TPE, they expressed the need for more in-depth training to improve their 
teaching skills and integrate the latest advances in therapeutic education. Continuing education is crucial to maintaining 
a high level of competency in TPE(12), as it allows healthcare professionals to adapt to changes in medical practices and 
patient needs(13,14). Regular training programs could therefore enhance the ability of healthcare providers to 
implement TPE more effectively and individually. 

4.4. Patient Perceptions: Engagement and Emotional Challenges 

 Healthcare professionals' perceptions of patient engagement in TPE were mostly positive, with many examples of 
patients becoming more independent and proactive after participating in TPE programs. These results are consistent 
with previous studies that show(6,15,16) that TPE can lead to better disease management by patients and 
improvements in their quality of life. However, it is important to note that some patients may experience difficulties 
fully engaging in TPE, particularly those dealing with emotional burdens or high stress levels. This observation is 
supported by the literature, which suggests that patients' psychological state can influence their ability to absorb 
information and actively participate in TPE(17,18). To overcome these challenges, it is crucial that TPE programs be 
designed to be flexible and tailored to the individual needs of patients, including psychological support for those who 
require it(8). 

4.5. Improvement of TPE: Perspectives and Recommendations 

 The suggestions made by healthcare professionals to improve TPE in hematology provide valuable insights. Allocating 
more time for TPE in consultation schedules is a key recommendation, reflecting a need to reorganize priorities within 
healthcare services to better integrate TPE. Moreover, investing in more diverse educational materials, including digital 
tools, could facilitate patient learning and improve the effectiveness of TPE programs. The emphasis on continuous 
training for healthcare professionals is also an essential recommendation. By ensuring regular access to specialized 
training, healthcare institutions can improve the quality of TPE offered, ensuring that healthcare providers are well-
prepared to meet the complex needs of hematological patients. 
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4.6. Impact on the Healthcare Provider-Patient Relationship 

Finally, the positive impact of TPE on the healthcare provider-patient relationship should not be underestimated. The 
results show that TPE fosters more open communication and strengthens mutual trust, which is crucial for the effective 
management of chronic diseases such as those encountered in hematology(19). This improvement in the healthcare 
provider-patient relationship itself can contribute to better treatment adherence and optimal clinical outcomes. 

5. Conclusion 

This study highlights the importance of TPE in hematology, while also underscoring the challenges faced by healthcare 
professionals in its implementation. The findings suggest that better resource allocation, continuing education for 
healthcare providers, and the adaptation of TPE programs to the individual needs of patients are essential to improving 
the effectiveness of TPE. By overcoming these barriers, it is possible to strengthen the role of TPE in the management 
of hematological diseases, with significant benefits for both patients and healthcare professionals. 

Compliance with ethical standards 

Disclosure of conflict of interest 

No conflict of interest to be disclosed. 

Statement of ethical approval 

The research protocol was approved by an ethics committee  

Statement of informed consent 

Informed consent was obtained from all individual participants included in the study. 

Reference 

[1] WHO reveals leading causes of death and disability worldwide: 2000-2019 [Internet]. [cited 5 May 2024]. 
Available at: https://www.who.int/en/news/item/09-12-2020-who-reveals-leading-causes-of-death-and-
disability-worldwide-2000-2019 

[2] WHO Regional Office for Europe. Therapeutic patient education: Continuing education programmes for health 
professionals in the field of chronic disease prevention: recommendations of a WHO working group. [Internet]. 
World Health Organization. Regional Office for Europe; 1998 [cited 3 May 2024]. Available at: 
https://iris.who.int/handle/10665/345371 

[3] Opsomer MA, Boulin M, Caillot D, Pernot C. Implementation of the therapeutic education program in patients 
with malignant hematological diseases in hematology, in a day hospital at the Dijon University Hospital - 
ScienceDirect [Internet]. 2014 [cited 25 Feb 2024]. Available at: 
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S2211104214000885?via%3Dihub 

[4] Bauchetet C, Préaubert-Sicaud C, Ceccaldi J, Farsi F, Donadey FL, Jaulmes D, et al. Recommendations for the 
implementation of multi-professional staff (SPP) in healthcare services. Bull Cancer (Paris) [Internet]. 1 Feb 2020 
[cited 25 Jan 2023];107(2):254‑61. Available at: 
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S0007455119304175 

[5] Mosnier-Pudar H, Hochberg-Parer G. Therapeutic education, group or individual: what to choose? Médecine Mal 
Métaboliques [Internet]. Sept 2008 [cited 2 Mar 2024];2(4):425‑31. Available at: 
https://linkinghub.elsevier.com/retrieve/pii/S1957255708740471 

[6] de la Tribonnière X. The future of ETP: an additional service or another medicine? Médecine Mal Métaboliques 
[Internet]. 1 May 2020 [cited 3 March 2024];14(3):207-13. Available at: 
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S1957255720001017 

[7] Haute Autorité de Santé [Internet]. [cited 26 Feb 2024]. Structuring a therapeutic patient education program in 
the field of chronic diseases. Available at: https://www.has-sante.fr/jcms/c_601290/fr/structuration-d-un-
programme-d-education-therapeutique-du-patient-dans-le-champ-des-maladies-chroniques 



International Journal of Science and Research Archive, 2024, 13(02), 1993–1998 

1998 

[8] Moriceau M, Saltel P. How to improve the relationship with the patient in onco-hematology? InfoKara [Internet]. 
2004 [cited 7 Aug 2023];19(1):3‑8. Available at: https://www.cairn.info/revue-infokara1-2004-1-page-3.htm 

[9] Promotion Santé Grand Est [Internet]. [cited 9 Sep 2024]. Evolution in 2021 of the teaching of therapeutic patient 
education in initial training and the place of simulation in this teaching: a survey of 92 French nursing training 
institutes. Available at: https://www.promotion-sante-grandest.org/index.php/se-documenter/nos-
veilles/education-therapeutique-du-patient/item/1411-evolution-en-2021-de-l-enseignement-de-l-education-
therapeutique-du-patient-en-formation-initiale-et-place-de-la-simulation-dans-cet-enseignement-une-
enquete-aupres-de-92-instituts-de-formation-en-soins-infirmiers-francais 

[10] de La Tribonnière X. The future of ETP: an additional service or another medicine? Médecine Mal Métaboliques 
[Internet]. May 2020 [cited 9 Sep 2024];14:207‑13. Available at: https://hal.science/hal-03491046 

[11] Cherillat MS. Evolution of practices and identity transformations at work among health professionals practicing 
therapeutic patient education [Internet] [phdthesis]. Université Clermont Auvergne; 2021 [cited 9 Sept 2024]. 
Available on: https://theses.hal.science/tel-03813742 

[12] Tribonnière X, Eglin I, Dauriat N, Mahjoub B. Skills and training in ETP. In 2023. p. 134-144.e2. 

[13] Tourette-Turgis C, Thievenaz J. Therapeutic patient education: field of practice and field of research. Savoirs 
[Internet]. 2014 [cited 26 Feb 2024];35(2):9‑48. Available at: https://www.cairn.info/revue-savoirs-2014-2-
page-9.htm 

[14] Golay A, Correia J, Pataky Z, Giordan A, Assal JP. Therapeutic patient education: towards a more humanistic 
medicine. Rev Med Suisse [Internet]. 11 Oct 2023 [cited 11 Sep 2024];8452:1887‑9. Available at: 
https://www.revmed.ch/revue-medicale-suisse/2023/revue-medicale-suisse-845-2/education-
therapeutique-des-patients-vers-une-medecine-plus-humaniste 

[15] Croiset A. ETP and quality of life An essential tool for the patient. Diabetes Obesity MG. 1 Mar 2016;11. 

[16] Perdriger A, Pouplin S, Dartois A, Beauvais C. Educational objectives and needs of patients with chronic 
inflammatory rheumatism. Rev Rhum Monogr [Internet]. June 1, 2013 [cited June 24, 2024];80(3):152-6. 
Available at: https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S1878622713000465 

[17] Bonnaud-Antignac A, Cousson-Gélie F, Flahault C. Health psychology and cancerology. The contribution of 
research for better care. J Psychol [Internet]. 2017 [cited June 24, 2024];351(9):34-40. Available at: 
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S1878622713000465 


